
FOI Request - Fly Tipping and Bulky Items - 101003664727

1. Monthly counts of fly-tipping 

2019 - 2020 2020 - 2021 2021 - 2022 2022 - 2023 2023 - 2024

Apr 32 20 32 17 8
May 20 38 13 11 11
Jun 24 40 9 15 12
Jul 17 35 13 15 20

Aug 15 29 9 10 12
Sep 30 28 14 9 10
Oct 21 25 12 13 9
Nov 16 32 16 9 15
Dec 11 16 8 5 6
Jan 18 17 21 11 17
Feb 25 17 8 26 13
Mar 11 35 6 11 11
Total 240 332 161 152 144

2. Monthly counts of fly-tipping by waste type 

2019 / 
2020

Furniture
Household 
Waste

Electrical/ white 
goods

Building 
materials

Commercial 
Waste

Tyres

Apr 2 17 3 7 0 3
May 3 10 0 6 0 1
Jun 4 15 3 2 0 0
Jul 4 10 1 2 0 0

Aug 1 9 2 2 1 0
Sep 6 17 4 2 0 1
Oct 8 6 2 3 1 1
Nov 7 3 1 3 1 1
Dec 4 3 3 0 0 1
Jan 4 9 3 1 1 0
Feb 7 10 4 0 2 2
Mar 4 5 1 0 1 0
Total 54 124 27 28 7 10

2020 / 
2021

Furniture
Household 
Waste

Electrical/ white 
goods

Building 
materials

Commercial 
Waste

Tyres



Apr 1 14 1 2 1 1
May 6 24 2 4 0 2
Jun 4 25 4 4 1 1
Jul 7 20 4 3 0 1

Aug 5 13 4 6 0 1
Sep 7 12 1 3 1 3
Oct 6 13 2 3 0 1
Nov 8 16 4 3 0 1
Dec 2 8 2 2 0 2
Jan 2 9 3 1 0 2
Feb 1 12 0 3 0 1
Mar 6 23 1 2 0 3
Total 55 191 28 36 3 19

2021 / 
2022

Furniture
Household 
Waste

Electrical/ white 
goods

Building 
materials

Commercial 
Waste

Tyres

Apr 4 21 4 2 0 1
May 1 10 0 1 1 0
Jun 3 2 1 1 0 2
Jul 3 6 1 0 1 2

Aug 2 6 1 0 0 0
Sep 1 9 2 0 0 2
Oct 3 3 1 2 0 3
Nov 3 8 3 1 0 1
Dec 3 4 1 0 0 0
Jan 2 14 2 0 0 3
Feb 1 4 0 2 0 1
Mar 1 4 1 0 0 0
Total 27 91 17 9 2 15

2022 / 
2023

Furniture
Household 
Waste

Electrical/ white 
goods

Building 
materials

Commercial 
Waste

Tyres

Apr 4 10 1 0 0 2
May 1 6 2 1 0 1
Jun 1 9 3 1 0 1
Jul 2 6 3 1 0 3

Aug 3 5 1 1 0 0
Sep 3 2 1 1 2 0
Oct 5 5 1 0 0 2
Nov 3 4 2 0 0 0
Dec 0 2 1 1 0 1



Jan 5 3 2 0 0 1
Feb 5 14 5 0 1 1
Mar 2 7 1 0 0 1
Total 34 73 23 6 3 13

2023 / 
2024

Furniture
Household 
Waste

Electrical/ white 
goods

Building 
materials

Commercial 
Waste

Tyres

Apr 0 4 1 2 0 1
May 3 5 1 1 0 1
Jun 3 7 2 0 0 0
Jul 4 11 2 0 0 3

Aug 1 7 3 0 0 1
Sep 0 6 1 1 0 2
Oct 3 4 1 1 0 0
Nov 2 8 2 0 1 2
Dec 1 4 0 0 0 1
Jan 3 12 1 1 0 0
Feb 2 7 2 0 0 2
Mar 3 6 0 2 0 0
Total 25 81 16 8 1 13

3. Monthly counts of fly-tipping by land type and location details 
8 Wards within Moray, fly tipping totals against each Ward           U = Urban R = Rural

2019 /
2020

U R U R U R U R U R U R U R U R
Apr 6 1 3 5 2 2 3 2 2 1 1 4
May 5 2 2 2 2 1 1 1 1 1 1 1
Jun 4 1 3 5 2 2 2 1 1 1 2
Jul 3 1 6 2 2 1 1 1

Aug 4 3 1 2 1 1 1 2
Sep 4 2 4 2 1 4 2 1 1 1 2 1 5
Oct 2 1 2 5 2 3 4 2
Nov 3 3 2 1 2 1 1 1 2
Dec 3 1 3 1 1 2
Jan 2 3 4 2 1 1 2 3
Feb 4 4 1 1 8 1 1 2 1 2
Mar 2 1 2 1 2 1 2

Forres Heldon & Laich Keith & Cullen
Speyside

Heldon & Laich Keith & Cullen
Speyside
Glenlivet

2020 / 
2021

Buckie Elgin North Elgin South
Fochabers

Buckie Elgin North Elgin South
Fochabers
Lhanbryde

Forres



U R U R U R U R U R U R U R U R
Apr 3 2 1 1 3 2 2 2 2 3
May 2 5 4 4 2 1 4 6 2 2 3 3
Jun 1 6 5 4 2 3 2 4 3 1 1 1 1 6
Jul 3 1 4 2 2 2 3 4 3 3 2 2 1 2

Aug 2 4 5 1 2 2 1 1 4 2 1 4
Sep 5 1 2 2 2 1 1 2 3 1 2 1 5
Oct 3 1 3 1 2 1 3 1 3 3 4
Nov 4 1 6 2 2 5 3 4 1 1 3
Dec 4 1 1 1 2 3 1 1 1 1
Jan 2 1 4 4 2 1 1 2
Feb 2 3 2 2 4 2 1 1
Mar 4 3 1 1 1 1 1 4 6 2 5 1 1 1 3

U R U R U R U R U R U R U R U R
Apr 2 1 5 2 2 4 3 1 6 1 1 4
May 2 1 2 2 1 2 1 2
Jun 1 4 1 1 2
Jul 1 1 1 2 4 2 1 1

Aug 1 1 1 3 1 1 1
Sep 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 2 2 3
Oct 2 1 2 1 2 1 1 1 1
Nov 1 3 2 2 2 2 1 1 1 1
Dec 3 2 1 1
Jan 1 5 1 2 2 3 2 5
Feb 1 3 1 1 1 1
Mar 1 2 1 1 1

U R U R U R U R U R U R U R U R
Apr 2 2 2 1 2 2 1 1 3 1
May 1 2 3 2 1 1 1 1
Jun 1 2 1 2 2 1 1 3 1 1
Jul 1 1 2 2 3 1 2 3

Aug 2 2 1 2 1 1 1
Sep 1 3 2 1 1 1
Oct 2 1 3 2 2 1 2

Forres Heldon & Laich Keith & Cullen
Speyside
Glenlivet

2022 / 
2023

Buckie Elgin North Elgin South
Fochabers
Lhanbryde

Lhanbryde
Forres Heldon & Laich Keith & Cullen

Speyside
Glenlivet

Forres Heldon & Laich Keith & Cullen
Glenlivet

2021 / 
2022

Buckie Elgin North Elgin South
Fochabers

2021
Buckie Elgin North Elgin South

Lhanbryde



Nov 1 3 1 1 3
Dec 1 1 1 1 1
Jan 2 3 2 2 1 1
Feb 2 6 1 5 3 2 1 1 3 1 1
Mar 2 1 2 2 1 2 1

U R U R U R U R U R U R U R U R
Apr 1 2 1 2 2
May 3 1 2 1 1 1 2
Jun 2 4 1 1 1 1 1 1
Jul 3 2 4 2 5 1 1 1 1

Aug 1 3 2 1 1 1 2 1
Sep 4 1 1 1 1 1 1
Oct 2 2 1 1 1 1 1
Nov 3 2 4 1 3 1 1
Dec 1 1 2 1 1
Jan 4 1 4 3 1 3 1
Feb 2 4 1 2 1 1 2
Mar 1 3 1 2 1 1 1 1

7. We do not currently operate any fly tipping prevention activities.

8. Monthly Fixed Penalty Notices issued for fly-tipping

Count of REFVAL Column Labels
Row Labels FPN Grand Total

2020
Jul 1 1
Sep 2 2
Oct 4 4
Nov 1 1

2021
Feb 4 4

5. Not held. We currently uplift fly tipping within our normal collection vehicles when they are in the area so we do not have separate costings for fly tipping. 
Information that is not held falls under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 - Information not held.

4. Not held. We do not record volume/weights of fly tipped materials as they are lifted within normal collection routes. Information that is not held falls under Section 17 of the Freedom of 
Information (Scotland) Act 2002 - Information not held.

6. Not held. We currently uplift fly tipping within our normal collection vehicles when they are in the area so we do not have separate costings for fly tipping. 
Information that is not held falls under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 - Information not held.

FPN Issued

Lhanbryde
Forres Heldon & Laich Keith & Cullen

Speyside
Glenlivet

2023 / 
2024

Buckie Elgin North Elgin South
Fochabers



Mar 4 4
Apr 4 4
Jul 1 1
Aug 3 3
Sep 2 2

2022
Apr 2 2
Aug 1 1
Nov 1 1

2023
Sep 1 1
Oct 1 1

2024
Jan 1 1

Grand Total 33 33

9. All items collected are recycled as best as possible into various materials; those that are general waste/unable to recycle are disposed of to landfill 2019-April 2023, and EfW from April 2023 onwards.
10. Our bulky collection vehicle is a 7.5 tonne box van with a tail and side lift, with a standard crew of two personnel, one driver and one operative.
11. No regular communications other than social media responses to questions relating to fly tipping.


