
FOI Request - Libraries, Leisure Centres and Art and Music Tuition – 101002970370 
 
1. For each library you are responsible for, please provide a list of and details of the times its 
opening hours have changed since January 2017 
 

OPENING HOURS AT 31 MARCH 

 2017-2019 2020 - Current 

Aberlour 16.0  16.0  

Buckie 45.0  36.0  

Burghead 11.0  8.0  

Cullen 12.0  12.0  

Dufftown 16.0  10.0  

Elgin 56.0  56.0  

Fochabers 29.0  10.0  

Forres 45.0  36.0  

Keith 40.0  30.0  

Lossiemouth 34.0  16.0  

Tomintoul 11.0  11.0  

Mobile 29.3  29.3  

 
 
2. For each leisure centre you are responsible for, please provide a list of and details of the 
times its opening hours have changed since January 2017 
 
The core hours of our facilities have remained largely unchanged over the years which are Monday 
to Friday operational from 7/7.30am until 9pm and then weekends are half days, staggered across 
the facilities. 
 
The exception to the 7am – 9pm is that, due to Covid restrictions in schools the Speyside facility has 
had to operate Monday to Thursday with a late afternoon opening time. 
 
3. Please provide the number of dedicated art tuition sessions provided to each primary school 
class in your area per week, for the last 5 school years, broken down by school 
 
Under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002, this information is not held. 
Class teachers provide occasional art lessons. 
 
4. Please provide the number of dedicated music tuition sessions provided to each primary 
school class in your area per week, for the last 5 school years, broken down by school 
 
Under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002, this information is not held. 
Class teachers provide occasional music lessons. 
 
 
5. Please provide the number of dedicated music tuition sessions provided to each primary 
school class in your area per week, for the last 5 school years, broken down by school 
  



Information contained in NATIONAL INSTRUMENTAL MUSIC SURVEY 2021: 
https://www.improvementservice.org.uk/news/november-2021/national-instrumental-
music-survey-2021 

  

School Year *Cost of one to one music tuition 

2021-22  
£0.00 

2020-21 annual charge based on 30 lessons 
£418.50 

2019-20 annual charge based on 30 lessons 
£418.50 

2018-19 annual charge based on 30 lessons 
£378.00 

2017-18 annual charge based on 30 lessons 
£378.00 

 
*Cost of group instruction slightly different. 
 
6. The number of new socially rented homes completed, by council ward, broken down over 
the last 5 financial years. 
 
Under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002, this information is not held 
broken down by ward. Under our duty to be helpful, please see table below which provides a 
breakdown of new lets by town. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Completion 
Year 

Buckie Elgin Forres Hopeman Keith Mosstodloch Total 

2016/17 16      16 

2017/18 15 16 16    47 

2018/19  36 32    68 

2019/20 28      28 

2020/21  50  22  30 102 

2021/22 
(projected) 

    33 
(expected 

March 
2022) 

46 79 

https://www.improvementservice.org.uk/news/november-2021/national-instrumental-music-survey-2021

